
Step 17 – Sample Analytics Reports  
Quarterly Report (June 1, 2008 – Aug 31, 2008) 

 
This report highlights the statistics derived from Google Adwords, Google Analytics and the Webalizer 
Statistics. 
 
Webalizer Statistics 
 

 
Fig.1. Summary of Statistics of reactiontechnology.com from May 08 to the beginning of Sept 08 

 
Fig. 1 illustrates your website statistics from April 08 to the middle of September 08. Notice the 
monthly increase in traffic, with the exception of a slight dip in July. Also, judging from the daily 
average recorded in the first half of September, the projected total traffic in September will be even 
higher than the previous months. It shows that the number of people visiting your website has been 
constantly increasing. 



 
Fig. 2. Top Content pages – June 1, 2008 to Aug 31, 2008 

 
Fig. 2 shows that the home page (“/” and “/index.html”) has the most traffic, consisting about 65% of 
the total page views. The contact.html and about.html pages also attracted a fair amount of traffic, 
which shows that visitors are interested in finding out more about the company. The 51.73% Bounce 
Rate, the number of visitors that exit the site after visiting only one page, also suggests that your 
website was able to attract about half of the visitors to find out more about your company. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Google Adwords 

 
Fig 3 Keyword Report – All Time 

 
From Fig. 3, you can see that the most searchable keywords are MOSFETS, polysilicon, MOS, and 
IGBT, each with over a thousand impressions. However, there are also other keywords that draw a 
significant amount of customers to your site. The total expenditure was $21.75. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 
Fig. 4 Ad Variations – Jun 1, 2008 – Aug 31, 2008 

 
Fig. 4 shows the statistics of your different web campaigns. You can see that Poly Sci on SiC and 
Quartz,     Inc. (NOT the Google maps one), Si Epitaxial Services, and Specialty Silicon Epitaxy are 
the most effective campaigns, each with almost 0.1% of their impressions turned into actual visits. 
You can also see that the ad on Google Maps was not doing too well, it had 187 impressions and yet 
no one has clicked on it. It is understandable because most users that search for specific keywords 
related to your company generally have an idea of what they are looking for, while the ads on Google 
Maps are more geared towards general customers that do not know the area very well. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Google Analytics 
 

 
Fig. 5 –     analytical visitor location map 

 
Fig. 5 illustrates a statistical analytic world map pinpointing the locations of visitors to your site from 
Jun 1st 08 to Aug 31th 2008. As you can see, your site gains a worldwide presence, while most visitors 
come from the continental United States, some hits also derive from central and western Europe, the 
Middle East, China, Australia, and Canada. 
 



 
Fig. 6 – Traffic Sources Overview – June 1, 08 – Aug 31, 08 

 
 
In Fig. 6, you can see that most of your traffic comes from different search engines. Among all the 
search engine referrals, visitors coming from Google organic searches played the biggest role with 
over 30% of the total traffic, while visitors from Yahoo organic searches also played a significant role 
with around 8% of the total traffic. It shows that your company already has solid rankings among 
some of the biggest search engines and that your company’s name is reaching out to the customers. 
Also, over 35% of your visitors came from direct traffic, which further shows the growth of your 
company’s reputation. 
 



 
Fig. 7 Top 10 Referring Sites – June 1, 08 – Aug 31, 08 

From Fig. 7, you can see that about 13% of your site’s traffic came from other referring sites. The 
number of referrals were quite evenly spread out among the top 10 referral sites, with globalspec.com 
proved to be most effective by referring 6 visitors to your site, two of which actually stayed and 
browsed more than one page (66.67% Bounce Rate). 
 
SEO Reports 
 
The following Search Engine Optimization Reports extend through the month of June 2008 and into 
the end of August. These reports provide a high level overview of the metrics that affect your sites 
visibility and accessibility according to search engine rankings. 
 
The longer your site contains the optimization necessary to promote it within search engine rankings 
the higher its ranking will become. These reports, which compose only four months cannot show the 
full potential of search engine optimization as that progress can only be seen over a much longer time 
period.  
 
However, these reports may give you an indication of what to expect in regard to an increasingly 
higher search engine ranking and visibility of your sight. 

 
 
 



 
Fig. 8 SEO Graphs – June 10, 2008 

 



 
Fig. 9 SEO Graphs – July 14, 2008 



 
Fig. 10 SEO Graphs – Aug 26, 2008 

 
From Fig. 8-10, you can see that despite slight fluctuations from a few categories, your listings have 
been gaining positions steadily. Also, your site has been gaining visibility as well, with a significant 



spike in July. It shows that the SEO work has been paying off and your site is attracting more and 
more traffic. 

 
Conclusion 
 
During the period between June 1, 2008 and Aug 31, 2008, your website has been steadily gaining 
popularity and the first half of September is looking good as well. This is largely due to the SEP work 
that was done to your site. However, there is still room for improvement, and we suggest you to 
consider the following… 
 
• Part of the reason your website has been gaining in search engine rankings is because of the 

increase in number of directory and social book marking sites that have selected your website into 
their listings for our targeted keywords. This leads to the increase in number of links that point to 
your site and that the Google spider would assume a greater importance for your site. Therefore, 
increasing the time and effort put into doing SEO work to your site would not only help advertising 
your site on other websites, but also help improve your search engine rankings as well. 
 

• Review the keywords that your site is currently targeting, and renew the list if necessary. Also, 
since most visitors that search for specific keywords like “silicon epitaxy” probably know what they 
are looking for, it would help to include more descriptive information for your ads to catch the 
attention of the visitors before they had to click on your link. 
 

• Remove the ads on Google Maps since it did not seem to be particularly effective, and spend the 
resources on more technically specific ads to focus on bringing in customers that would be 
interested in your services instead of just the general public. 


